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From: Shava Lawson
To: Thatcher Bailey
Cc: Kutira Graham
Subject: Fwd: Donation from Amazon
Date: Thursday, October 15, 2020 5:26:00 PM


FYI, Thatcher- Jared Axelrod is who should be thanked for generating the VPT amazon
donation. See below for details, but all we have is his email address: jaxelrod@amazon.com


Sent from my iPhone 


Begin forwarded message:


From: "jeff@volunteerparktrust.org" <jeff@volunteerparktrust.org>
Date: September 21, 2020 at 9:08:00 AM PDT
Subject: RE:  Donation from Amazon


﻿
Hello Hanna,
 
We do need your help in submitting our invoice. Please reach out to the point of
contact at Seattle Parks Foundation, Shava Lawson, Director of Fiscal Services, who is
included here.  The foundation is unable to access the Amazon portal, and the Amazon
record for SPF contains incorrect information. 
 
Anything you can do to help straighten this out would be very much appreciated.
Thanks so much!
 


Jeff Rinedahl
Administrative Services Manager 
jeff@volunteerparktrust.org
volunteerparktrust.org


 
 


From: Williams, Hanna <hannamw@amazon.com> 
Sent: Sunday, September 20, 2020 8:51 AM
To: jeff@volunteerparktrust.org
Cc: Brian Giddens <briangiddens@hotmail.com>
Subject: RE: Donation from Amazon
 
Hi Jeff,
 
The PO for this funding has been approved. You can now submit your invoice via Payee
Central under the PO number 2D-04104227. It is important to note that the invoice
must be dated 9/19/2020 or later for compliancy purposes. I have listed instructions
on how to submit an invoice in PC below. Please let me know if there is another point
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of contact I should be reaching out to with Seattle Parks Foundation.
 
Thank you!
Hanna
 
Steps to invoice Amazon using Payee Central


1. Login to https://payeecentral.amazon.com and select the “Invoices” tab
2. Click “Create Invoice”


1.  If you have a PO number, enter PO number and see a pre-populated
invoice. Add invoice number, invoice date, review and submit.


2.  If you don’t have a PO number, click “I don’t have a purchase order
for this invoice” and fill out the pre-populated form with required
information.


3. When adding the Amazon contact, please note that Payee Central does not
accept e-mail addresses that do not end in @amazon.com (e.g., the alias
ending in @amazonstudios.com does not work for this web-based form). 
Please add the email address (@amazon.com) of your Amazon business
contact to fill out the form. 


4. The description field shows as optional, however, we recommend that you
include a detailed invoice description, which will help your Amazon
business contact properly process the charge. 


 
 


From: jeff@volunteerparktrust.org <jeff@volunteerparktrust.org> 
Sent: Thursday, September 17, 2020 11:36 AM
To: Williams, Hanna <hannamw@amazon.com>
Cc: Brian Giddens <briangiddens@hotmail.com>
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Donation from Amazon
 


CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not
click links or open attachments unless you can confirm the sender and know
the content is safe.


 
Thank you, Hanna. I have forwarded the PO for Amazon’s donation to Seattle Parks
Foundation since we do not have access to their Amazon account. Their account
information in Amazon’s system will also need updating by SPF. If there are any
problems, I will let you know.
 


Jeff Rinedahl
Administrative Services Manager 
jeff@volunteerparktrust.org
volunteerparktrust.org


 
 


From: Williams, Hanna <hannamw@amazon.com> 
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Sent: Thursday, September 17, 2020 5:05 AM
To: jeff@volunteerparktrust.org
Subject: RE: Thank you
 
Hi Jeff,
 
The billing team notified me that it looks like your company is already set up in our
system. The purchase order simply has to go through our approval system prior to
releasing funds. I will keep in touch, and please feel free to reach out should you have
any questions.
 
Thank you!
Hanna
 


From: jeff@volunteerparktrust.org <jeff@volunteerparktrust.org> 
Sent: Wednesday, September 16, 2020 4:56 PM
To: Williams, Hanna <hannamw@amazon.com>
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Thank you
 


CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not
click links or open attachments unless you can confirm the sender and know
the content is safe.


 
Thank you, Hanna. I’ve not yet received the account email. I’ll keep checking my junk
mail just in case. If I don’t receive it by tomorrow, I’ll let you know.
 
 


Jeff Rinedahl
Administrative Services Manager 
jeff@volunteerparktrust.org
volunteerparktrust.org


 
 


From: Williams, Hanna <hannamw@amazon.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, September 16, 2020 12:42 PM
To: jeff@volunteerparktrust.org
Subject: RE: Thank you
 
Hi Jeff,
 
I have opened a purchase order request for this donation. You should receive an email
prompting you to set up your account.  Afterwards, you can use the instructions below
to submit an invoice. Please let me know if you have any questions.
 
Thank you,
Hanna
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Steps to invoice Amazon using Payee Central


1. Login to https://payeecentral.amazon.com and select the “Invoices” tab
2. Click “Create Invoice”


1.  If you have a PO number, enter PO number and see a pre-populated
invoice. Add invoice number, invoice date, review and submit.


2.  If you don’t have a PO number, click “I don’t have a purchase order
for this invoice” and fill out the pre-populated form with required
information.


3. When adding the Amazon contact, please note that Payee Central does not
accept e-mail addresses that do not end in @amazon.com (e.g., the alias
ending in @amazonstudios.com does not work for this web-based form). 
Please add the email address (@amazon.com) of your Amazon business
contact to fill out the form. 


4. The description field shows as optional, however, we recommend that you
include a detailed invoice description, which will help your Amazon
business contact properly process the charge. 


 
 


From: jeff@volunteerparktrust.org <jeff@volunteerparktrust.org> 
Sent: Wednesday, September 16, 2020 2:06 PM
To: Williams, Hanna <hannamw@amazon.com>
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Thank you
 


CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not
click links or open attachments unless you can confirm the sender and know
the content is safe.


 
Thank you, Hanna.  Volunteer Park Trust (and our Volunteer Park Amphitheater
Project) operates under the 501(c)(3) fiscal sponsorship of Seattle Parks Foundation.
The purchase order should be made out to them:
 


Seattle Parks Foundation
Attn: Shava Lawson,  Director of Fiscal Services
105 South Main Street #235
Seattle, WA 98104-3476


 
Their nonprofit IRS EIN tax ID number is: 91-1998597.
 
If you need any other information, just let me know.  Much appreciated!
 


Jeff Rinedahl
Administrative Services Manager 
jeff@volunteerparktrust.org
volunteerparktrust.org
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From: Williams, Hanna <hannamw@amazon.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, September 16, 2020 11:33 AM
To: Jeff Crandall <jeff@volunteerparktrust.org>
Subject: RE: Thank you
 
Hi Jeff,
 
It is nice to meet you! I will be working with you to open a purchase order request for
these funds. What is the full legal entity name of your company?
 
Thank you!
Hanna


From: Brian Giddens <briangiddens@hotmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, September 16, 2020 1:27 PM
To: Axelrod, Jared <jaxelrod@amazon.com>
Cc: Jeff Crandall <jeff@volunteerparktrust.org>; Ruff, Emi <emiruff@amazon.com>;
Williams, Hanna <hannamw@amazon.com>
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Thank you
 


CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not
click links or open attachments unless you can confirm the sender and know
the content is safe.


 
Jared:
Jeff Rinedahl, cc'd above, can provide details on how to make the payment.
Thanks
Brian
 


From: Axelrod, Jared <jaxelrod@amazon.com>
Sent: Wednesday, September 16, 2020 11:24 AM
To: Brian Giddens <BrianGiddens@hotmail.com>
Cc: Jeff Crandall <jeff@volunteerparktrust.org>; Ruff, Emi <emiruff@amazon.com>;
Williams, Hanna <hannamw@amazon.com>
Subject: RE: Thank you
 
Thanks Brian. Good talking with you, and glad we can be of support to this effort. And
yes, please keep me posted for the concert series next year.
 
I’ve copied my colleagues Emi and Hanna on this email; with whom should they work to
help facilitate payment?
 
Jared
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From: Brian Giddens <BrianGiddens@hotmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, September 16, 2020 11:17 AM
To: Axelrod, Jared <jaxelrod@amazon.com>
Cc: Jeff Crandall <jeff@volunteerparktrust.org>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Thank you
 


CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click
links or open attachments unless you can confirm the sender and know the
content is safe.


 
Jared:
Thanks so much for your support of the Volunteer Park Amphitheater project, and
for Amazon's support. We very much appreciate the $50,000 contribution, which
will make it so much easier for us to meet the current gap between costs and
funds raised.
I also appreciate your willingness to touch base at the beginning of 2021 to
discuss possible sponsorship by Amazon of our Concert Series to celebrate the
opening of the Amphitheater next summer.


Brian
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